BID RESULTS
ASPHALT LAID-IN-PLACE

VENDOR KECT MONTESANO |PCI INTERCOUNTY ELQ CLOVE PALEEN
ASPHALT CONCRETE

Tack Coat - delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tack Coat - w/o delivery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ASPHALT CONCRETE LAID IN PLACE

1. TYPE 3 BINDER COURSE

l.a.in place $97.20 $117.00| $115.00 $100.29| $138.45 $99.00 No Bid
1.b. in place with keys $99.20 $121.00| $120.00 $101.29| $142.54| $102.00 No Bid
1.c. in place with tack coat $99.20 $122.00| $120.00 $102.15| $142.92| $102.50 No Bid
1.d. in place with tack coat & keys $101.20 $125.00| $124.00 $103.15| $147.00| $105.00 No Bid
2. TYPE 6F3 TOP COURSE

2.a.in place $97.20 $114.99| $116.00 $102.20| $134.95 $99.70 No Bid
2.b. in place with keys $99.20 $119.50| $121.00 $103.20| $138.57| $102.70 No Bid
2.c. in place with tack coat $99.20 $119.25| $121.00 $104.00| $139.15| $103.70 No Bid
2.d. in place with tack coat & keys $101.20 $123.20| $125.00 $104.40| $142.80| $105.70 No Bid
3. TYPE 7F3 TOP COURSE

3.a.in place $106.20 $125.00| $125.00 $109.29| $142.82| $108.00 No Bid
3.b. in place with keys $108.20 $129.00| $130.00 $110.29| $146.45| $111.00 No Bid
3.c. in place with tack coat $108.20 $128.00| $130.00 $111.15| $147.00| $111.00 No Bid
3.d. in place with tack coat & keys $109.20 $132.00| $134.00 $112.15| $150.70| $114.00 No Bid
4. TYPE 1 BASE

4.a.in place $97.20 $117.00| $115.00 $99.29| $142.75 $99.00 No Bid
4.b. in place with keys $99.20 $121.00| $120.00 $100.29| $147.85| $102.00 No Bid
4.c. in place with tack coat $99.20 $122.00| $120.00 $101.15| $147.80| $102.00 No Bid
4.d. in place with tack coat & keys $101.20 $125.00| $124.00 $102.15| $152.90| $105.00 No Bid
MILLING

0-5000 square yards $6.90 $6.60 $12.00 $3.20 S4.48 $4.80 $16.00
5001-10000 square yards $4.10 $4.96 $10.00 $3.20 $4.33 $4.60 $12.00
10000-15000 square yards $3.25 $4.83 $9.00 $3.00 $3.40 $4.50 $7.00
15001 plus square yards $3.10 $4.83 $8.00 $3.00 $3.40 $4.00 $6.50
Trucking (per day per 8 hour day) $1,275.00 $1,550.00($1,600.00 $1,200.00($2,013.00|$1,440.00|5$1,600.00
Disposal (square yards) $13.75 $1.58 $2.00 $5.00 $2.22 $18.00 $2.00
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